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Noted Julliard Artist Stauffer Named Head Of 
Natural Science Division MEHEGAN PERFORMS FRIDAY 

SPECIAL JAZZ CONCERT 

The appointment of Dr. 
Charles H. Stauffer, of Canton, 
New York, to be professor of 
chemistry and chairman of 
the division of natural sci- 
ences at Bates College next 
fall, was announced Tuesday 
l»y Charles F. Phillips, Bates 
president. 

The new post of division 
chairman takes effect with 
the retirements of two long- 
time Bates teachers, Professor 
Karl S. Woodcock, head of the 
physics department, and Pro- 

fessor Walter A. Lawrance, 
chemistry department head. 

Dr. Stauffer's appointment 
will unify administration of 
the work in astronomy, biolo- 
gy, chemistry, geology, math- 
ematics, and physics. Current- 
ly department chairman and 
professor of chemistry at St. 
Lawrence U n i v e r s i ty, Dr. 
Stauffer is highly regarded as 
a scientist and teacher. 

A native of Harrisburg, Pa., 
Dr. Stauffer graduated with 
honors from Svvarthmore Col- 
lege in 1934 and earned his 
MA. and Ph.D. degrees at 
Harvard University in 1936 
and 1937, in the fields of 
physical and organic chem- 
istry. 

From 1941 to 1958 he was a 
member of the chemistry fac- 
ulty at Clark University, and 
has held his present post since 
that time. At St. Lawrence he 
has been chairman of the sci- 
ence building committee and 
chairman of the pre-medical 
committee. 

A member of Sigma Xi fra- 
ternity, the American Chemi- 
cal Society, and the New 
York Academy of Sciences, Dr. 
Stauffer is also a fellow of 
the American Association for 
the Advancement of Science. 

Non-Violent Action Coordinator 
Speaks On Mississippi Tonight 

Mr. Robert Swann, coordin- 
ator of the New England Com- 
mittee for Nonviolent Action 
and controversial architectur- 
al designer/builder will speak 
in the Filene Room tonight at 
^•.00 P.M. His topic will be 
"Rebuilding Mississippi To- 
day." 

Swann, who will be going 
to Mississippi immediately 
»fter he speaks this evening, 
comes to Bates with an in- 
teresting background. He at- 

Oral Interp.  Class 
Gets High Honors 

Three Bates Students won 
high ratings at the Maine 
College Oral Interpretation 
Festival held last Saturday, 
Feb. 20, at Bowdoin College. 
, Noreen Nolan '65, Sandra 
Root Cook '65, and Doug White 
'66 attended the festival with 
Associate Professor of Speech 
Lavinia Schaeffer. Miss Nolan 
fend Mrs. Cook won certificates 
of excellence, and Doug White 
was rated as superior. 

The students are in Miss 
,Schaeffer's Oral Interpretation 
Class. 

tended Ohio State University 
Where he majored in Fine 
Arts and Painting. After leav- 
ing school he served two years 
in prison and three years on 
parole as a censcientous ob- 
jector in World War Two. 

He served three months in 
Federal Prison in 1962-63 for 
"aiding and abetting" the 
boarding of Polaris subma- 
rines, and is currently on five 
years' probation for that of- 
fense. 

Swann, an architectural de- 
signer and builder by profes- 
sion, has built co-op housing, 
open occupancy housing and 
Frank Lloyd Wright houses. 

Four years ago he closed 
his sixteen year-old business 
and helped to organize the 
New England Committee for 
Non-Violent Action. He now 
works as coordinator for that 
organization. 

He has been asked to go 
to Mississippi to direct work 
camps of white and Negro vol- 
unteers, and to supervise the 
rebuilding of several church- 
es which were burned down 
last summer and fall. 

Please  turn  to  page   3 

The Robinson Players will 
feature the Japanese film 
"Roshomon" on February 27 
at 7 and 9 in the Little Thea- 
tre. 

The story opens as three 
men discuss the recent mis- 
fortune of a traveling merch- 
ant. A bandit, in the seclu- 
sion of a forest, murdered the 
merchant and attacked his 
wife. The crime is enacted 
four times according to the 
conflicting versions of the 
bandit, the wife, the dead 
merchant through a medium, 
and a witness. 

"Roshomon," which will be 
presented with English sub- 
titles, received the Academy 
Award for Best Foreign Film, 
Grand Prize in the Venice 
Film Festival, and National 
Board Review Selection as 
Best Foreign Film. 

Filmed in 1951, it has been 
favorably reviewed in the New 
York Times, Saturday Review 
of Literature, Esquire and 
Newsweek. 

its development through the 
restatement made by Shear- 
ing, Peterson, and Bill Evans. 
He will demonstrate the styles 
of such major contributors to 
jazz as Earl Hines, Fats Wal- 
ler, and Teddy Wilson. 

The second half of the per- 
formance will feature selec- 
tions from the present jazz 
scene. 

Mehegan 
structor at 
Music,   and 
lege, Colum 
has    also 
teacher   of 
entertainers 
musicians. 

has been jazz In- 
Julliard School of 
at Teachers Col- 

bia University. He 
been the private 
many    celebrated 
and   professional 

John Mehegan will give a 
jazz concert this Friday eve-', 
ning at 8:00 PM in the Gannet 
Music Room of Pcttigrew Hall. 
Mr. Mehegan will be accom- 
panied by his wife in a per- 
formance of jazz for dual 
pianos. 

During the first part of Fri- 
day night's performance, Me- 
hegan will explain the history 
of jazz, telling about its roots 
in the marches and blues and 

Roshomon 
Academy Award 
Winner This  Sat. 

From 1957 to 1960 Mehegan 
was the jazz critic for the New 
York Herald Tribune. He is 
jazz commentator for radio 
station WNYC of New York 
City. 

Mehegan     has      published 

several books dealing with 
methods and studies for the 
jazz pianist. His work, Jazz 
Improvisation is the first 
"comprehensive series of 
books to codify and delineate 
the elusive procedure known 
as jazz improvisation." 

In another book, The One 
World of Jazz, Mehegan 
speaks of "unison" in the 
functioning of theorist, crea- 
tor, and performer. "In the 
relatively small world of jazz," 
he writes, "theorist, creator, 
and performer do not exist 
apart from each other; they 
are one. . ." 

Relating this idea of unity 
to creation, Mehegan con- 
cludes, "It is this 'oneness' 
of creation which, more than 
anything else, makes the 
teaching and playing of jazz 
a vital and necessary part of 
our musical life." 

SEA MEETS 
TOMORROW 

APPLICATIONS 

The Student Education As- 
sociation will hold its Feb- 
ruary meeting tomorrow 
night, February 25 in the Fac- 
ulty Lounge at 7 P. M. Guest 
speaker will be Mr. J. Wen- 
don Russell, Superintendent 
of Lewiston Public Schools, 
who will discuss "The Chang- 
ing Role of the Public School 
Superintendent." Interested 
students are welcome. 

The Publishing Association 
is now accepting applications 
for the position of editor of 
the Student, Mirror or Garnet. 
The P.A. is also accepting ap- 
plications for business man- 
ager of the Student or the 
Mirror. Applications may be 
given to Peter d'Errico, STU- 
DENT Editor; Andrea Buck, 
MIRROR Editor; Deke Hurst, 
GARNET Editor; or mailed to 
Box 309. 
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"PEACE CORPS AT HOME" 
SEEKS COLLEGE VOLUNTEERS 

Volunteers In Service To 
America — this month launch- 
ed a full scale effort to re- 
cruit college students for ac- 
tive service in the nationwide 
war against poverty. 

Often described as the Peace 
Corps at home VISTA is seek- 
ing men and women over 18 
who are willing to give a year 
of their talents and energies 
to help the poor help them- 
selves. VISTA Volunteers will 
live and work with the pov- 
erty-stricken in migrant la- 
borer camps, Indian reserva- 
tions, urban slums, rural 
areas, and institutions for the 
physically handicapped, men- 
tally ill and mentally retard- 
ed. 

Glenn Ferguson, Director of : 
VISTA,   said that  all  college i 
students   are   eligible   to   be | 
Volunteers. A sampling of cor- 
respondence at    VISTA head- 
quarters shows that many un- 
dergraduates    think    that    a 
year of such practical exper- 
ience will be a valuable asset 
when they return to complete 
studies.  As a Volunteer,  stu- 
dents may discover a career in 
nursing, teaching, social work, 

social welfare or other public 
programs. 

Volunteers will work on a 
variety of tasks in education, 
health, counselling and com- 
munity development. At the 
request of local groups, they 
will be teacher aides, tutors, 
block group leaders, inter- 
viewers for welfare and em- 
ployment services; help con- 
duct day-care centers, and 
work with the elderly, young 
children and non - English 
speaking Americans. 

Volunteers will receive a 
monthly living allowance in- 
cluding travel and medical 
care and, at the end of their 
year of service, a readjust- 
ment allowance of $50 for each 
month served. Married cou- 
ples may serve if both hus- 
band and wife apply together 
and there are no dependents 
under 18. Volunteers can ex- 
press a preference for area of 
assignment 

For further information or a 
preliminary application write 
VISTA, Office of Economic Op- 
portunity, Washington, D. C. 
20506. 

"This place is like dance, man. 
four back!" 

3 steps forward, and 

Quality Gas & Used Cart 
"At Lowest Prices" 

NEHI BEVERAGES, INC. 
Bottlers of 

SACRE'S   DISCOUNT  CORNER Royo| Crown Cola and 
College & Sabattus Sts. Dj.t Rite ■q-i- 

LEWISTON 
Opp.  Luiggis j Washington  St. Auburn 

DAVIS CADILLAC CO., INC. 

CADILLAC ■ OLDS - LAND ROVER 

Established 1928 

Valuo-Rated Used Car. 

6 EAST AVENUE 

DLDIMDilLI 

UWtSTON 
Tel. 7*4-4441 

Cassara To Speak 
On Religion And 
Today's Campus 

Dr. Ernest Cassara, Associ- 
ate Professor at Tufts Univer- 
sity and a Billings Lecturer, 
will speak on the topic, "A 
Religion Relevant To Today's 
Campus" in the Filene Room 
at 8:00 P. M. Wednesday, 
March 3rd. 

His lecture will trace the 
unrest in religious groups dur- 
ing the past hundred years 
and show the problems con- 
fronting individuals and 
groups as they seek a mean- 
ingful, relevant religion in 
this time of uncertainty. 

He will also speak to a joint 
meeting of Student Religious 
Liberals of Bates and Bowdoin 
College on "Church and State 
in a Pluralistic Society". The 
lecture, to be held at the Moul- 
ton Union, Bowdoin, at 7:30 
P.M. on Sunday March 7th, 
will concern the historical 
background of the separation 
of church and state in the 
USA and the problems con- 
fronting the nation in the fu- 
ture. 

Rifle Club Seeks Members 
And Administrative Okay 

Attention: Men 

We would like to remind 

you that there is just a limited 

supply of ping pong paddles, 

cue sticks and other supplies 

for the lower Chase Hall area. 

Unnecessary damage and lack 

of respect for the equipment 

will soon result in a corres- 

ponding lack of activity. 

THE MEN'S COUNCIL: a.v. 

lyj^^JJ 
MANUFACTURERS NATIONAL 

LEWISTON AUBURN, MAINE 

Member F. D. I. C. 

EMPIRE 
MAT. 2:00 
EVE. 
6:30-8:30 

Thur„ Fri.. Sat - Feb. 25, 26. 27 
And Sun. Mat. Feb. 28 

THE THREE  STOOGES 
IN 

"THE OUTLAWS 

IS COMING!" 

Sun. Eve., Feb. 28 and 
Mon., Tues., March 1. and 2nd 

ROBERT TAYLOR 
DEBORAH KERR 
PETER USTINOV 

"QUD 
VADIS" 

Technicolor 

The first meeting of a po- 
tential Bates Rifle Club was 
held last week. The meeting 
was opened by O. C. Presi- 
dent Newt Clark, who turned 
it over to Ken Petke who did 
most of the work of organiz- 
ing the group. 

More than 400 colleges have 
rifle clubs, and in some of 
them shooting is a varsity 
sport. The Bates club would 
have matches with other 
Maine colleges or postal 
matches, in which the Nation- 
al Rifle Association sends tar- 
gets to different schools, 
which use them and send 
them back for judging. Com- 
petition would start with rifles 
and grow to include pistols. 
The club would offer training 
for those who are interested 
but have limited experience. 
Collecting and shooting an- 
tique guns is another project- 
ed activity of the club. 

The club would be affiliated 
with the National Rifle Asso- 
ciation, which would provide 
twelve guns for every ten peo- 
ple in the club. The Outing 
Club, under whose auspices 
the Rifle Club would be 
started would pay ten dollars 
every  two years for the  use 

* PUBBIBM 

"SANITONE" 

The World's Most 
Recommended 

DRY CLEANING 

Campus Agent 
CAROL BLAISDELL 

KATHY  BUTLER 

LeBLANC'S 
CLEANERS 

10 Lafayette Street 

Coin-Operated 
DRY CLEANING 

GIANT 12 lb LOAD 

Pressing on Premises 
i Min. Walk from Campus 

Open Till 9 Daily 

RTTZ 31   Maple St. 
Lewiston 

THURSDAY   -   FRIDAY   -  SATURDAY 

"THE  HORROR  OF 
PARTY BEACH" 

- Plui - 

"THE   CURSE   OF   THE 
LIVING CORPSE" 

SUNDAY  -  MONDAY -  TUESDAY 

"WHERE LOVE 
HAS GONE" 

Susan   Hayward -   Bette  Davis 

-  ADULT  DRAMA  IN   COLOR  - 

-  Also  - 

"HUD" 
PATRICIA   NEAL   —   Belt   Actross    1964 

COMING 

VINCENT  PRICE 

"TOMB OF LIGEIA" 

of the guns. Individual fees' 
would pay for targets and 
ammunition. 

The main problem for the, 
club, aside from attaining ad- 
ministrative permission to se- 
cure and store guns on the 
campus, is to find an indoor- 
range. There are many outside 
ranges in the area for use 
when the weather permits, 
but no inside range has yet' 
been found. 

There will be another meet- 
ing for anyone interested in- 
joining the Rifle Club. Look 
for notices or contact Newt 
Clark or Ken Petke. 

FLAMINGO MOTEL 
1241 lUbum imtt 
I1WIITON. MAIM 

1  MJU to U«faH« ft 

500   P*M   Pro-   Uwtoton Tirnelll 
tall It 

LARGEST MOTH. IN TOWN 
NEAREST  MOTEt  TO  C041SOI 

COFFEE SHOP — TV — PHONES 

For  ■iiinmHiKi   Tat,   7S4-444S 
7SS-1444 

Norris - Hayden 

Laundry 

Modern  Cleaners 

CAMPUS AGENTS 
JOHN TUSKIS 

BILL MacNEVIN 

PriSCllla nunaay 
Friday - Saturday . Sunday 

"THE  PINK PANTHER" 

David Niven, Peter Sellers 
A Detective Tries to Outwit a 
Jewel Thief at an Ski Resort 

Color — UA 

"633 SQUADRON" 

Cliff Robertson • Color - UA 
British Airmen and Norwegian 
Underground Join Forces in a 

Crucial Raid in WW H 
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Swann from page 1 

His goal for the project is 
that the rebuilding of these 
churches will result not only 
in new structures, but also rec- 
onciliation and future coop- 
erative undertakings by Mis- 
sissippians of both races. 

CHARLIE LOVE TELLS TALES 
OF MYSTERIOUS LITTLE  MEN 

In March he will take a 
group of high school students 

•on a tour of the South. These 
youngsters will help rebuild 
the social hall of the Mt. 
#Pleasant Baptist Church in 
Gluckstadt, Mississippi. 
Swann hopes that these stu- 
dents will be able to associate 
with both white and Negro 
students of their age  in the 
cooperative venture. 
• 

Swann's lecture is another 
in the series of talks and dis- 

cussions on controversial is- 
sues sponsored by the Cam- 
pus Association. 

FLANDERS 
QUALITY MENSWEAR 

•Court St.     Auburn, Maine 

Bass Weejuns 

Bates College had a taste 
of the "old west" last Thurs- 
day night, when Charlie Love 
'66 presented a paper and 
played tapes of "old west" 
tales, some tall and others, 
strangely enough, not so tall. 
An old timer by the name of 
Barber dictated this story, 
which has the distinction of 
being the only extant written 
record of the story. 

"In the summer of 1933, a 
fellow by the name of Baker 
discovered a cave on the 
north-east flank of the Wind 
River Mountains, which the 
Indians at one time had in- 
habited. Besides finding arti- 
facts, he discovered a tunnel 
eighteen inches high. Neither 
the artifacts nor the tunnel 
proved to have any special 
significance. 

"Several years later, Mr. Ba- 
ker returned to the cave and 
found it excavated by a Mr. 
David. Mr. David had found 
some artifacts similar to the 
ones Mr. Baker had found. 

"Mr. Baker expressed won- 
der whether the Indians had 
used the side tunnel or not. 
Mr. David said that the In- 
dians hadn't but the little 
yellow men had. This fact 
proved interesting to Mr. Ba- 
ker, and he began to talk with 
a number of friends who knew 
more about the little yellow 
men via tales of the Indians. 

Franck And Faure Featured 
In Chapel Recital Sunday 

COOPER'S   RESTAURANT 
FINE  FOOD  &  QUICK  SERVICE 

CALL AND ORDER — YOUR FOOD WILL BE 

READY WHEN YOU GET THERE 

Snbartu* St. Lewirton 

Georgio's Drive-In  Restaurant 
SPAGHETTI — PIZZAS — ITALIAN SANDWICHES 

Now Location 

Corner Ruaell and Sabattus Streets, Lewicton 

Tol. 783-1991 

Also 740 Mi not Avonue, Auburn 

Tol. 783-2981 

Call —Your Order Will Bo Roady WKon You Oot Thoro 

"Included in this informa- 
tion was the fact that a mum- 
mified little yellow man had 
been found and was being 
studied in Casper, Wyoming. 
Studies of the little man, in- 
cluding x-rays, revealed that 
he had a set of full adult 
teeth. The mummy was found 
in a squatting position. In 
ihis position he measured six 
and a half inches high. 

"He looked just like a mo- 
dern human being except that 
his neck was two and a half 
times the length of the mo- 
dern human neck. The ears 
were pointed like a mouses' 
and the little man was cov- 
ered with blond hair. His 
bones were fused as in a ma- 
ture adult. His shoulders and 
arms had muscles like a 
blacksmith's. And his legs 
were like those of a runner. 
Doctors tried to explain that 
the little yellow man was not 
a member of a race but an 
embryo. However, they could 
not explain the adult teeth or 
the disproportionate size of 
the neck. 

"Mr. Baker was able to 
glean very little information 
from the ancient medicine 
men of the Shoshone tribe, 
concerning this subject. The 
reason for this is that the old 
Indians were very superstiti- 
ous in regards to the little 
men. And even to this day, 
they will not enter certain 
canyons in the Wind River 
Mountains. 

"The validity of these stor- 
ies can be questioned. Other 
than this no other research 
had been done on the little 
people. Apparently, there was 
a race of little men, for the 
mummy is no myth. X-rays 
prove that. How they orig- 
inated as a race, or where 
they came from, can only be 
speculated on." 

The above is just a sampl- 
ing of one of Charlie's not so 
tall tales. If you are inter- 
ested or gullible, go see Char- 
lie Love. He will turn you into 
a full-fledged believer. 

The work of Cesar Franck 
and Gabriel Faure will be fea- 
tured in a recital in the Bates 
College Chapel on Sunday 
February 28, at 8:00 P.M. 

D. Robert Smith, Professor of 
Music, will play the first se- 
lection, Chorale for Organ in 
B Minor, by Cesar Franck. 

Organ works entitled chor- 
ale usually are based upon fa- 
miliar congregational hymns 
known as chorales. Franck's 
use of the word is unique, for 
his Three Chorals for Organ, 
his last compositions, are ac- 
tually fantasies upon his own 
original themes. 

In this, the second of the 
set, three themes form the 
basis upon which Franck 
builds a dramatic and master- 
ful structure, using the con- 
trapuntal techniques of pas- 
sacaglia, fugue, and eventual- 
ly simultaneous combination 
of themes. His harmonies are 
characteristically chromatic. 

Franck presided in the or- 
gan loft at Sainte-Clothilde in 
Paris for over 30 years and 
his music reflects a spirit of 
mysticism, other-worldliness, 
or even sophisticated naivete. 
His compositions for organ re- 
established a literature of au- 
thority for this instrument. 

Soprano Sandra Root Cook 
and Baritone Peter C. Allen 
will sing in Requiem, by Ga- 
briel Faure. They will be ac- 
companied by the Bates Col- 
lege Chapel Choir and D. Ro- 
bert   Smith  Organist-Director. 

This musical setting of the 
Mass for the Dead wa.s first 
heard in 1888 at the Made- 
leine in Paris. At that time 
nobody believed in the im- 
portance of a composer who 
could live for nearly half a 
century without even attempt- 
ing to write an opera. Furth- 
ermore this discreet and sub- 

FOR '65 CHEVROLETS 

FOR OK USED CARS 

FOR FINE GM SERVICE 

LOUIS! 
675   MAIN   STREET 

PHONE 784-7368 
LEWISTON 

tie music was in sharp con- 
trast with the obvious and 
over-blown style then pre- 
vailing. 

Nevertheless, this Requiem 
is now counted among the 
most select settings of the text 
and as an example of French 
art at its most fastidious. It 
reflects Faure's original melo- 
dic invention and his person- 
al idiom regarding chord pro- 
gressions and modulations. 

In 1896 Faure became or- 
ganist at the Madeleine and 
Professor of Composition at 
the Conservatory. He is known 
as a leading composer of the 
French Art Song, and the 
teacher of many distinguished 
pupils. 

COFFEE HOUR 

An informal coffee hour for 
recent delegates to the Stu- 
dent Civil Rights Conference 
at Amherst College will be 
held on Thursday February 25, 
at 8:00 PM in the Women's 
Union. There will be oppor- 
tunity for discussion of the 
views and the opinions aired. 
Delegates to the conference 
were H. Mosher, A. House, R. 
Oakes, L. Balk J. Grossman, 
K. McKusik, B. Stanton, and 
P. Hardy. 

Please 
Patronize 

Our 

Advertisers 

Two-In-One Taxi 
25 SABATTUS STREET 

LEWISTON 

Nearest To The Campus 

Tel. 784-5251 
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EDITORIALS 
The STUDENT Doodles 

or 
A LETTER TO THE FUTURE SENATE 

Since you do not exist yet, this is perhaps the best 
time to give you some neiptul advice, in case you have 
misunderstood, tne mam concern of tne Senate is the 
college which at .bates means the administration. Oh 
yes, me students are important, but if you become too 
concerned with their only relative importance, then you 
will be misguided In your interactions wnh the admin- 
istration. At tiates everythmg must be kept within the 
proper perspective. 

Being comparatively tradition-less, you look for 
examples wnicn illustrate how an organized body can 
aeai with an administration. Down aouth and in the 
INorth there are administrations of whites who will 
not allow the Wegro to be a human being. The organ- 
ized groups of the Civil Kights movement stage demon- 
strations and some of their members even go to jail for 
what they believe. But this is not the example tor you 
to follow. After all everyone knows that student rights 
are not human rights- 

At Boston University there is an administration 
which has forgotten its proper role in the educational 
process. The president put the college radio station 
under the control of the Vice President for University 
Affairs (the propaganda office) and denied student par- 
ticipation in its operation. When the B. U. NEWS pro- 
tested, the administration got the wild idea of controll- 
ing the newspaper as well. The Congress (your equiva- 
lent at B. U.) voted to publish an opposition paper. 
There would be two newspapers operated by the same 
staff, but one was to parrot the administration's wishes 
and the other to consist of censor-free information. The 
president acceded to the Congress demand that he with- 
draw his request for censorship rights. Moreover the 
Congress has further demanded that it be named the 
legal publisher of the B. U. NEWS rather than the pres- 
ident as it stands now. Realistically speaking, the BU 
Congress could never serve you as a good example. Ob- 
viously, B.U. is not a small, friendly co-educational 
institution. . . 

The best advice seems to be to follow the example 
of the preceding Senates. These two Senates under- 
stood our administration best and knew just what to 
do. They were never too antagonistic and seldom made 
a stand on any issue. Oh, Yes, this year the Senate 
v/ent on record as being in favor of opening the wom- 
en's dorms for the entertainment of guests. But this 
foolish act could not be taken as being indicative of the 
consistent policy of the Senate. Like the preceding 
Senates, you should form committees; then you can 
look busy without doing anything. When it looks as 
if you might have to make a decision, take a poll and 
then no one can blame you for representing the student 
body. If the students or STUDENT criticize you, just 
grumble that they do not know what they are talking 
about. Never openly respond to criticisms by showing 
what the Senate is doing, or the truth would then be 
known. Only in this way will you, the Senate, live a 
long peaceful life and the students be kept in the pro- 
per perspective. 

A. G. 
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LETTERS TO 
THE EDITOR 

MISUNDERSTOOD 

To the Editor: 
An apology to anyone who 

thought, from the term "mis- 
appropriation" in my letter 
last week, that I was refer- 
ring to an embezzlement, etc., 
of college funds. Webster's 
defines "misappropriate" as 
"to appropriate to a bad, in- 
correct, or dishonest use; mis- 
apply." The latter usage 
was certainly intended: I feel 
(yes, as a starry-eyed idealist) 
that a lot of money could be 
put to better use at Bates. 

Also: I'm not part of any 
crusade or secret movement to 
do away with the administra- 
tion; I'm just a student. 

Tim Jurgens '67 

BOMBS 

To the Editor: 
Re: the Bomb Shelter. There 

have been posted no notices 
as to what to do in case of an 
air raid warning. What is the 
procedure and why isn't it 
posted? What happens on 
Sundays when the buildings 
involved are locked? 

Pessimistic 

Jobs In Europe 
Still Available 

Published weekly at Hathorn Hall, Bates College, during the 
college year. Printed at Pine Tree Press, 220 Gamage Ave., 
Auburn, Maine. Entered as second-class matter at the Lewis- 
;on Post Office Jan 30,1913, under the act of Mar. 3, 1879. 

The American Student In- 
formation Service announces 
that there are still more than 
20,000 summer jobs available 
in Europe to U. S. college stu- 
dents. The jobs are being 
filled on a first come, first 
served basis and the ASIS is 
granting a $390 travel grant 
to each of the first 5,000 appli- 
cants. 

Some positions pay $400 a 
month with no previous exper- 
ience or foreign language 
ability required. Room and 
board are often included. The 
most requested jobs are resort 
work, office work, lifeguard- 
ing, sales work, shipboard 
work, factory work, child care 
and camp counseling work, 
farm work and restaurant 
work. Interesting summer 
work not found in the U.S. is 
living as a guest of well-to-do 
European families in return 
for teaching their children 
English. 

Job and travel grant appli- 
cations and detailed job des- 
cription (location, wages, 
working hours, photographs, 
etc.) are available in a 36- 
page booklet which interested 
students may obtain by send- 
ing $2 (for the booklet and air 
mail postage) to Dept. IV, 
ASIS, 22 Ave. de la Liberte, 
Luxembourg City, Grand 
Duchy of Luxembourg. 

Dr. Alfred J. Wright Chair, 
man of the Language Depart- 
ment has much material on 
file from various organiza- 
tions which help American 
Students find jobs in Europe. 
Interested students should see 
Dr. Wright in his office on the 
third floor of Hathorn. 

The New Curriculum ... 
A Real Cultural Heritage 

by one gdg 

The purpose of a school cur- 
riculum, at least as I see it, 
is not that of providing a ser- 
ies of obstacles which the stu- 
dent is expected somehow to 
overcome. Nor is it the test- 
ing grounds by which a group 
of pedants attempt to measure 
how near a group of students 
are to their own "enlightened" 
minds. It is rather the means 
by which a group of exper- 
ienced students (known more 
commonly as teachers) afford 
the opportunities for spiritual 
and intellectual development 
to other students. And it 
seems to me that Bates al- 
ready possesses such means 
in CULTURAL HERITAGE. 

The core, the very heart 
and soul of our curriculum 
should in my opinion be a 
Cultural Heritage sequence in 
which the student begins his 
studies with his own times. 
This may seem "odd" to some 
of you who are already fami- 
liar with the way in which 
one pursues "Cultch." But in 
fact it really is not. It is only 
making explicit what is in- 
deed implied in this rather 
unusual course. We are con- 
cerned with what makes us 
what we are today — and this 
depends to no small degree 
upon what we think we are 
today. A fairly good way of 
starting such self-examina- 
tions is to look with a critical 
mind at where one is. rathei 
than where one has been. Thif 
is why (i.e., one good reason 
why) a student should begin 
with his own times, and he 
should do so explicitly and 
consciously. 

Thus, in that inimitable 
manner so characteristic of 
"Cultch," students (exper- 
ienced as well as in-exper- 
ienced ones) will examine 
those powerful ideas, out- 
standing books and works of 
art that contribute to making 
them what they are that day. 
It would be a six-term se- 
quence beginning with our 
own times, then in the second 
term returning to the ancient 
world trying to retrace the 
contributions which that 
world has made. The third 
and fourth terms would con- 
sider the efforts of the men 
of the Middle Ages, and the 
contributions of the Renais- 
sance and the subsequent two 
centuries. The fifth term 
would be devoted to the nine- 
teenth century and finally, in 
the sixth term, the student 
would return to his own time! 

Does this, some may well 
ask, mean that the first and 
sixth terms will be identical? 
The answer is obvious. Not 
unless the student and our 
times are so. For what I would 
hope would come from this, 
indeed what I'm certain would 
come from this is the growing 
awareness of every student's 
intellectual development in 
his or her own mind. This is 

the raison d'etre of any school, 
any curriculum and any group 
of teachers. This is why a cur- 
riculum must come first and 
a calendric reform second. 

Now      having     mentioned 
what I would  regard  as the ' 
sole core   course  of   a   NEW 
BATES   PLAN   FOR   BETTER 
EDUCATION, I would like to 
go on to other aspects of the ' 
curriculum.    Two other areas 
of studies should, in my opin- 
ion, be required of every stu- , 
dent: at least four terms of a 
foreign    language, and    four 
terms of science. The remain- 
der of the College Curriculum . 
should be filled with as many 
and   as varied  a   number  of 
courses as there are teachers 
who can conduct them.   This ' 
would    mean    increasing the 
number of seminar courses — 
a facet of the present and pro- 
posed plans of education that . 
is sadly deficient. And all the 
pious rationalizations   cannot 
and could not excuse any mo- 
dern  college    from   fulfilling 
this most rewarding of learn- > 
ing experiences. 

I could go on and on in this 
vein, but permit me to turn 
to the question that is soon 
to be before the faculty. 
Namely, the new calendar. T 
propose that the so-called new 
calendar — which has been 
designated by its chief propo- ' 
nent as something that will 
be for Bates "easy in, easy 
out" — be rejected. In its place 
I would advocate the follow-' 
ing: first, changing from a 
student program of five 
courses meeting three times a 
week to four courses meeting' 
four times a week; second, al- 
tering the calendar to a quar- 
terly system in which we 
make use of three of the four . 
quarters. A student who wish- 
es to accelerate would then 
take five courses four times 
a week and he would grad- 
uate in three years. A stu- 
dent who wishes to decelerate 
would be able to take two 
courses four times a week and 
graduate in five years. And , 
finally the student following 
the old four year approach 
would take four courses four 
times a week. 

The good thing about this 
proposal is that there are real 
options here, no gimicks — 
like free tuition for the ac- 
celerators, etc. — no come-ons, 
no hard-sells or soft-sells, just 
the opportunity for each and 
every student to fulfill his 
own true goals. 

No 

Commercials 

on 

Channel  10 
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GUIDANCE 
Monday, 1 March 

Fuller    Brush    Company— 
J4en interested in Dealer 
Training Program; Summer: 
Seasonal Sales Opportunities. 
Interviewer: Mr. Norman Elie. 

17. S. Public Health Service- 
Male positions as Program 
Representatives (non-techni- 
cal) leading to Public Health 
tAdvisorship, Interviewer: Mr. 
William White. 

Tuesday, 2 March: 

F. W. Woolworth Company 
—Men wanted for Manage- 
ment Training Program, Inter- 
viewer:    Mr.    E.    V.    Burns. 

Young Women's Christian As- 
sociation—Positions for wom- 
en as Teenage and Young 
Adult Program Directors; 
Health and Physical Educa- 
tion Directors, Interviewer: 
Mrs. Roberta Austin. Graduate 
School of Public Affairs (State 
University, Albany, N. Y. — 
Men and Women interested 
in Graduate Training and Car- 
eers in Political Science, Pub- 
lic Administration, and Politi- 
cal Economy, Interviewer: 
Dean Lewis Welch. 

Wednesday, 3 March: 

Filene's — Men and Women 
wanted for Retailing Career 
Development (Executive 
Training Program), Interview- 
er; Mr. Richard Malatesta '45, 

Continued on page 6 

BATES ABROAD '65 

On Route 100 & 202, Just Out- 
slde Auburn, Half Mile from 
.Turnpike Exit No. 12 . . Phone 

783-1498 . . . Room Phone 
STARDUST MOTEL 

Exclusive But Not Expensive 

i 
Headquarters for Diamonds 

Member 
American Gem Society 

'     National Bridal Society 

CHARGE-BUDGET 

Available 
'     on easy payment terms 

83 Lisbon St. Lewiston 

•xh II Ti 

T«l   7M-14M 

•ININ9   rACH.mil-   COCXTAIU 

'Auburn   Motor   Inn 
751  Washington St.    Auburn 

Tal. 784-4906 
,   Restaurant - Directly across 

JERRY'S   VARIETY 
203 College St. Lewiston 

Sunday Newspapers 
ICE CREAM and  CANDY 

Of All Kinds 

A new year 
Toyko, Japan 

Dear School, 
Where I am living now is 

about an hour away from cen- 
tral Tokyo. My little part of 
Tokyo has none of the sophis- 
tication that a suburb of New 
York would have however. 
Kignt next door 10 my house 
mere is a farm with lots of 
pigs and several acres filled 
with rows of various green 
things. Near by there are lots 
oi small snops wnicn spread 
tneir wares out into the street. 
I'ne Housewives here snop 
every nignt. 11 you go at live 
o'clock or so you can see them 
witn tneir baskets and their 
cniidren, buying things for 
supper as most do not have 
ice boxes to store things in. 
(as I write 1 see that 1 could 
go on like this forever, talk- 
ing about farms and baskets 
and the way the women car- 
ry their warm babies on their 
backs under wide winter 
capes. But I do have one idea 
which I can see vaguely wait- 
ing up ahead and I will try 
to get to it). 

I don't go into Central Tok- 
yo (ie. Ginza) very often and 
I am learning especially not 
to go by myself This is per- 
haps the hardest thing for me 
since I came to Japan. I have 
no place where I can go and 
walk and be by myself. I am 
learning to hush my indepen- 
dent heart though, and to let 
other people help me. But 
now, especially since the year 
has turned and my thoughts 
are looking toward a new end, 
there is a part of me waiting 
for Maine and New York and 
Colorado, for all the wild or 
the crowded places where I 
can walk alone and be free 
in because they are my own. 

Here I have my room and 
that is my own. It is more 
mine than any room I have 
ever had. As I have not yet 
brought any of my friends to 
my    house no one    has ever 

SEDARD'S 
MAINE'S ONLY 

Drive-In Pharmacy 

Phone 784-7521 Lewiston 
Cor.   College & Sabattus   Sts. 

Delicious PIZZA 

and 

Italian   Sandwiches 

Real Italian Spaghetti 

AUGUSTA - BRUNSWICK 

LEWISTON - POLAND 

really been in it except me. I 
am beginning to leel as 
though It is very untouched 
and almost as though it has 
been mine for too long. It 
would be hard to have some- 
one come in after all this 
time. 

I do not feel as though my 
room is even attached to the 
house. Because the Japanese 
have always had to live so 
close together and so find 
ways to preserve their priv- 
acy, my room has frosted 
glass windows. At first I 
found them frustrating be- 
cause I had always been able 
to see out. But now I like 
them. Because they are cloud- 
ed and only a very light 
otherworldly sort of sun comes 
into my room I really feel as 
though it is a place suspend- 
ed. My room is not in any 
country. There is no time in 
my room. 

I remember once when I 
was about seven — it was aft- 
ernoon and there was a new 
snow in the small city park 
near my home. I stayed until 
after everyone who had a 
home to go to had gone home, 
(there are always a few old 
men and a cat or three left) 
I wasn't trying to be bad. I 
was just Being. I didn't notice 
that all the mothers and chil- 
dren had gone and that ii 
was beginning to get dark. I 
was playing by myself, mak- 
ing a small igloo out of snow. 
I remember how it was very 
small. When it was finished I 
lay on my back in the snow 
and put my head into the ig- 
loo. It was very quiet and 
light inside. I lay happy and 
lost, thinking of the small 
squirrels and birds that would 
come after I had gone, to 
spend the winter night in the 
round snow house that I had 
made. 

As I walked home I must 
have known that maybe this 
was one of the last times. That 
must be why I remember it 
so well. Only children have 
that kind of freedom to be 
lost in and even then I must 
have known and told myself, 
remember. 

But I am lucky I think be- 
cause here ■— even after I 
have grown up to be so hur- 
ried and hard — suddenly I 
have space again and I can 
be lost. My room has a straw 
mat floor which is like hav- 
ing a huge clean table where 
you can spread things out and 
make things. If I am sewing 
I can stick pins into the straw 
mat for keeping them, and if 
I am drawing my pencils are 
not always rolling away and 
off the edge of the table. If 
the grandmother in my fam- 
ily didn't call me to come and 
eat or call me for the bath, I 
feel as though I could go on 
forever. 

But Tokyo is not my own. 
When I am in my room and 
feeling so free and alive, I 
have such energy. I want to 
go out and use it, to walk and 

walk, and feel my freedom in 
this way to. But though Tokyo 
is huge and jumbled and 
filled with people, (no one in 
America can imagine it. Now, 
when I think of New York I 
think of empty spaces and 
scattered people) for me there 
is no freedom there. Instead of 
the great lostness and inhibi- 
tion one feels in a big city, in 
Tokyo I feel like a sore thumb. 
When I first came I was very 
brave. With my new excite- 
ment and New Yorker's con- 
fidence I was always jauntily 
venturing forth alone. But 
each time I came back a lit- 
tle more tired, standing on the 
train, fighting inside to get 
home. 

ine faces i see in lokyo 
nave peruaps sometmng oi 
tne stoic new England char- 
acter in tnem. in a way 1 feei 
as odd in lokyo as i might 
upon walking into a small 
town in Maine where one or 
two families have lived—been 
born, grown, loved and died— 
for a nundred years or more, 
untouched, with only them- 
selves to help through the 
frozen winters and the pov- 
erty. This is only my own 
idea and I think it is with 
something of this hate that 
faces in Tokyo look at me. 
They want new things so bad- 
ly and yet they are very proud 
and hate this longing in them- 
selves. In turn they hate me 
as an American and so a sym- 
bol of new things, ("new 
things" may seem vague but 
at present I think this is as 
far as the idea goes in the 
mind of the average Japanese. 
They themselves are in part 
so new—they have no way to 
discriminate between all the 
new things which they have 
suddenly been exposed to). 

Now I am beginning to ac- 
cept this with some objecti- 
vity but it is still hard. I am 
learning to understand it a 
little though, and even be 
fascinate by it. I think be- 
hind those faces the old and 
the new are fighting with all 
their might. They cannot love 
each other yet, as this is just 
the beginning. Each one is 
rejecting the other. Yet It Is 
impossible for one to win. 

If these faces are to become 
open, inside the old and the 
new must come together. If 
there is love, as in any real 
love I think, each whole part 
will be able to continually 
give and renew the energy of 
the other. Then Japan can be- 
gin, to grow from the bottom 
up. 

Tom  Neville 

P.S. It is a strange place to 

meet him but I am beginning 

to learn to read Robert Frost. 

This is almost as good as hav- 

ing Maine to walk in by my- 

self. 
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VICTOR NEWS 
COMPANY 

50 Ash St. Lewiston 
opposite Post Office 

Largest  Selection 
of Paperbacks in the State 

Barnes  &  Noble College 
Outline Series 

SCHOOL SUPPLIES 

Open Seven Days a Week 

THE  FILM SHOP 
Warren S. Shaw Jr. 

Cameras   -    Film 

Photographic  Supplies 

Discount to  Bates  Students 

52 ASH STREET 

Opposite Post Office 

LEWISTON TEL. 784-4431 

.: Louis P. Nolin  :. 

JEWELER 

133 Lisbon Street 
Lewiston, Maine 

Compliments 

HANSON'S BARBER SCHOOL 

390 Lisbon St. 
LEWISTON, MAINE 

Clark's Pharmacy 

Drugs Chemicals 

Biologicals 

MAIN  ST.  at  BATES ST. 

Tel.  783-2011 

NANKING HOTEL AND 

RESTAURANT 

Good Chinese Food 

"Watch for our Chinese 

Smorgasbord" 

Park Street Lewiston 

SAM'S   PIZZA 

'GOOD  ITALIAN  FOOD" 

you've tried the rest— 

now  try  the  best. 

T;.rockmortimer 

ALONZO... WHAT'S 
¥11TM THE 

CAMP I-K? 

Mtfu.Oir  KEEPS  M/ HEAD 
w«M;a)/r net PS M> 
HAIR DOWN EVEN WHEH 

,£RF*sy   KID 
STKFF   WON'T, 
AHD(S) I'M 
AFRAID   OF 

THE DHHK. 

AFRAID  or TRE~ 
VARKf .. . OM   A 
BEAUTIFUL PAy 
LINE   THIS? I 

HAVE   yOU EVER. 
WoHDfRFD    WHAT MOULD 

HAPPEN IF TUB 
SUN WENT our 
•Rl&tfT MOW? 
HAVE you etigR 
THOUGHT ABOUT 
THAT  THS.0CK? 

3! 

PEOPLE   WOULD    ST/(RT   RUHNIHH 
nnouHb  RECKLESSLV •• ■ AND you 

KNOW   WHAT HAPPENS 
WHEN   PEOPLE START 

. -RUNNING 
"(h/lt~   AROUND? 

&£_••• THEy 
STEP ON 
TOADS! 

MEAN, AFTER 
ALL,Lin  IS 
VERy   PRECIOUS 
AND Wf  SHOULD 

TRJ TO 
PRESERVE 
IT... 

yOU'KE   RI6HT, 
ALONZO... THE   HOST 
WONDERFUL   THING 

I   /svb   ABO0T  LIFE 
-        IS  BE IN 6 

ALIVE. 

THAT'S 
WHAT 

5. 

A. 
NOT    EXACTLY 

SAID.- ■ |  SAID 
THAT   THE 
MOST 
WONDERFUL 
THIH6   ABOUT 

LIF£~   IS   NOT 
0\   B£IMG 

VEA D. 

H£*»   AllKKK 

Guidance continued from pg. 5 

Polaroid Corporation — Male 
Chemists for Research and De- 
velopment Work, Interviewer: 
Mr. Robert Palmer. Public 
School Teaching in Burnt 
Hills, New York (9 A.M.), Rep- 
resentatives: Mr. Walter Reid, 
Mr. William Carow. See Pro- 
fessor Kendall about any 
Teaching  Interviews. 

Thursday, 4 March 

Federal    Reserve    Bank    of 
New York—Men interested in 

JEAN'S 
Modern   Shoe   Repair 

P. F. Sneakers - Year round 

Repair all styles of shoes 

195 Main St. Lewiston 

TURGEON'S 
PRESCRIPTION 

PHARMACY 
A. Turgeon, Reg. Ph. 

392 Lisbon St.   Lewiston, Me. 
Tel. 783-I486 

ZENITH  HEARING  AIDS 
BATTERIES  AND 

ACCESSORIES 
FOR ALL MAKES 

Main Street Lewiston 

PINELAND 
MOTEL 

A Motel The Whole Family 
Will Enjoy 

Located on U. S. 202 
2 Miles North of Maine 

Turnpike Exist 12 
Washington   St. 
Auburn, Maine 
Dial 783-2044 

Management Training Pro- 
gram, Interviewer: Mr. Mar- 
tin French '52. Liberty Mutual 
Life Insurance Company — 
Men and Women for Under- 
writing, Claims, Sales, and 
Risk Analysis, Interviewers: 
Mr. W. L. Usher, Mr. Richard 
Holter, Mr. Richard Borneman, 
Mrs. Eileen Tremblay. Public 
School Teaching in Madison, 
New Jersey (2 P.M.), Repre- 
sentative: Mr. Robert Clem- 
ence. Check with Professor 
Kendall on Teaching Inter- 
views. 

Friday, 5 March: 

Chase Manhattan Bank — 
Men interested in Develop- 
ment Program for Potential 
Bank Officers (Marketing, 
Lending, Investing,    Manage- 

Howdy 
Beefburgers 
Beefburgers  15c 

French  Fries   12c 

Cold Drinks 

Thick Shakes 

512 Canal St. Lewiston 
(1  block from Ritz Theatre) 

open daily until 12 
Fri.  . Serf,  until   1:00 A.M. 

ment), Interviewer:  Mr. Don- 
ald O. Cameron.    Massachus- 
etts    Mutual Life    Insurance 
Company — Men and Women 
wanted for Development Pro 
gram in Management Opera 
tions and    Techniques,    Pro 
gramming and Systems Anal 
ysis,    New   Product  Develop 
ment, Investments, Group Ac 
tuarial, Proposal Writing, Job 
Analysis,  Group Pension   Ad 
ministration,   Group   Claims 
Summer   Actuarial    positions 
for   junior men,   Interviewer 
Mr.   Arthur   Stemens.    Naval 
Research    Laboratory — Men I 
and Women for   Research in i 
Physics, Math, and Chemistry, i 
Interviewer: Mr. Bruce Wald. 
New  England Life Insurance 
Company — Men and Women 
sought for positions in Actua- 
rial Claims,    Field    Auditing, 
Methods   Analysis,   Program-1 
hing, Settlement Option Anal-' 
ysis,     Underwriting,     Install- 
ment Analysis, Programming, 
Research,    Pension    Analysis, j 
Policy    Change    Calculations. I 
Statistics, Underwriting; Sum-! 
mer    Seminar    Program    for 
Sophomore   and   Junior Men, 
Interviewer: Mr. John A. Cur- 
tis '33. 

All interested Students 

should sign up for interview 

appointments at the Guidance 

and Placement Office as soon 

as possible. 

FERN'S 

TAX I 

784-5469 

STERLING PATTERNS 
la 

Towle —  Gorham  —  Lumt 
Reed and Barton 

International — Wallace 

JEWELERS      1   /iVI/l/l//if\ I 
SINCE 1859     \S<3lfVV(l LCI 

50 Lisbon Street     Dial 784-5241 

Career Information 

Comprehensive literature 
covering careers in the U. S. 
Foreign Service has recently. 
arrived at the Placement Of- 
fice. This information includes 
recent changes in the exam- 
ination and appointment as- 
pects of application proce- 
dures. 

Other information comes 
from Newsweek in the form 
of a College Newsletter. This 
pamphlet discusses career op- 
portunities and working con- 
ditions in several major U. S. 
cities. A number of these 
neswletters are available on 
request at the Placement Of- 
fice. 

Lewiston Auto Sales 

HONDA - SAAB 

MICRO - SIPEING 

810 LISBON ST. 

LEWISTON 

TEL.   783-2051 
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BEK'S BANTERTrack Team Loses To R- '• 

Bobcat of the week 
The Bobcat award this week 

•goes to freshman basketball 
player Howard Alexander, na- 
tive of Montgomery, Alabama. 

Howie's surprising addition 
*to the basketball team this 
year has provided the team 
with an extra dose of enthus- 
iasm and talent. His calibre 
of play has been consistently 
good, and last week it came 
forth in a brilliant display of 
,dexterity. 

Against Colby it was How- 
ie's conversion of a crucial 
one-and-one    foul     situation 

that produced the tying  and 
winning points in the game's 

•final seconds. 
In addition to 18 points in 

this game, he garnered an 
additional    18 against   Tufts, 

'and 22 against Clark. We 
applaud this consistently fine 
play, and look forward to 
three more years of the same. 

FORTUNATO'S TEXACO 
Cor. Sabattus &  Howe St*. 

Dial 782-9076 
Cor. Main & Ruuell Sts. 

Dial 782-9158 
Lewiston, Maino 

• 
ROG-MOC 

"Genuine Hand Sewn 
Moccasins &  Slippers" 

Imported   English   10-oz, 
Water-Proof Chrome Leather 

• Made to Order 
103 Minot Ave., Auburn, Me. 
Open Til 8:30 and Saturdays 

DIAL 782-6295 

By Bob Bekoff 

The basketball schedule 
draws to a close their week, 
and all make-up games will 
be held either Friday or Sat- 
urday. It looks like 'Coach' 
Reiley made a cozy bet with 
his squad from S.S. If they 
win a game, it would be an 
act of God. 

The intramural track meet 
will be held Sunday, and bas- 
ketball players (under 200 
pounds) will be eligible. My 
prediction is that Off-Campus 
is going to enter a dark-horse 
team headed by the fellows 
from the Colonial House. They 
will be very hot and hard to 
handle on the first few laps. 

As mentioned last week, 
signups for handball and 
squash are now being taken. 

THE 
HAMBURG HOUSE 

10  VARIETIES   JUMBO 
HAMBURGERS 

Corner Maple &  Lisbon  St. 

SKI-INN 
Your One Stop Ski Shop 
Sales • Rental • Service 

5 Washington St. 
AUBURN, MAINE 

And  Lost Valley  Ski  Area 

MAYTAG COIN 

OPERATED LAUNDRY 

Owner: A. W. Chaloux 

Sabattus St. Lewiston 

A little more interest in 
squash would be helpful in 
making the competition a lit- 
tle sharper. 

In this last column I would 
like to express my apprecia- 
tion to Hymie Cox for provid- 
Ing the statistics, and "Chick- 
en-Legs" Pequignot for his in- 
centive. 

The Intramural Man of the 
Week award goes to Chip De- 
Lise for something, I'm not 
sure just what he did. 

Anyone of "questionable 
character" desiring to take 
over this prestigous task 
should contact. Slick Nick or 
Jon Wilska. The only prereq- 
uisite is completion of Phys. 
Ed. 302M., acceptance of the 
Bates Prep School Plan, and a 
desire to leave a bright mark 
on the school. 

Good-bye Nick 

Phone 782-1116 

DESJARDINS 

SERVICE STATION 

For Your Cars Most 
Frequent Needs 

Roland B. Desjardins, Prop. 
714 Main Street Lewiston, Me. 
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LITTLE CASINO 
37 LISBON STREET 18   CANAL   STREET 

Dancing Every Friday and Saturday Night 
To Live Music with "THE ALL-AMERICANS" 

Lunches & Dinners Everyday — 11:00 A.M. til 7:00 P.M. 
Reservations May  Be Made — Call Before 8:00  P.M. 

MART 
CONVENIENT 

LAY-AWAY PLAN 

OPEN DAILY 

UNTIL 10:00 P.M. 
Main Street, Lewiston 

An Invitation to Bates Students to Shop at the 
MAMMOTH MART for a Complete Selection of 

Clothing, Shoes, Records, Books, Sporting Goods, 
Domestics, Etc. 

By Ed Wells 

Bobcat thinclads lost last 
Saturday to a formidable Uni- 
versity of Rhode Island team 
by a score of 69-44. Though 
the Rams gained only seven 
first places versus Bates' six. 
they managed to sweep three 
events thereby attaining the 
winning margin. 

Consistency 

For the Bobcats, Paul Sa- 
vello jumped 22'10" in the 
broadjump to win in a close- 
ly matched event. Wayne 
Pangburn, in his consistent 
style, garnered first place in 
the 35 lb. weight throw with 
a toss of 53'8". Paul Mangan- 
ello won the 45 yard dash in 
5.4 seconds. In the two mile 
Bob Plumb tore down the 
field of competitors to win in 

10 minutes 11 seconds. Tom 
Bowditch, in his best jump of 
the season cleared the bar at 
6'4V. Keith Harvie edged out 
the field in the low hurdles 
to cross the line in 5.7 sec- 
ond. 

One cage record was set in 
the pole vault. Fred Sculco of 
the Rams cleared 14'%" to be- 
come the first man to clear 
14' inside the Bates field 
house. Former record was 
13'11% set by Mayland of the 
University of Vermont in 1964. 

Meet Bowdoin 

The Cats meet the Bowdoin 
Polar Bears this Saturday at 
2:00 P.M. Both teams will be 
well balanced assuring an- 
other exciting Cats • Bears 
event in States Series com- 
petition. 

Basketball  Standings 
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CUMMINGS SETS 
SCORING MARK 

Coach Peck gives Milestone Award to Co-Capt. Seth Cummings 

GUARANTEED   SERVICE                             DISCOUNT   PRICES 

DO IT YOURSELF 

» CAR CARE CENTER 
— OR WE WILL DO IT FOR YOU — 

• Home of the 50c Car Wash 

BRAKE SERVICE — TUNE-UPS 

• 26 LOWELL STREET - Open 7 day* a week • 782-5866 

Italian  Sandwiches 
French Fries 

7 Days A Week 
• Fried Clams 
• Fried Chicken 
• Onion Rings       •    Chili 
• Spaghetti     •      Pizza 

EAT  OR  TAKE   OUT 
AT THE 

POTATO PIT 
314 Lisbon Street       Lewiston 

Open 2 P.M. til 12 P.M. 
Telphone 782-9135 

SETH CUMMINGS 
Co-capt. Seth Cummings, a player on the Bobcat 

basketball squad since his freshman year, set a per- 
sonal scoring record last week against Tufts. By scor- 
ing IS points in the game, Seth entered an elite pla- 
teau of Bobcat athletes, the 1,000 point — a career 
mark. 

To date, the Shrewsbury, Mass. native has now 
garnered 1,021 points. This is not far behind the all 
time Bates high of 1089, set in the seasons 1948-52 by 
Larry Quimby, son of Brooks Quimby, professor of 
Speech. 

For his outstanding achievement, Seth was award- 
ed a commerative basketball by Coach Peck. We would 
like to extend our heartiest congratulations. 
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Cats Take 3 Straight Basketball Games 
Beat Colby 68-67 In Final Seconds 
Handily Drop Tofts 81 - 73f Clark 83 - 72 

By NICK BASBANES 

There is a strange breed of pool player, and a curious 
species of ping-pong advocate, that insists upon blam- 
ing his own inadequacies upon defenseless cues and 
paddles. Instead of kicking himself in the pants, as 
would naturally be expected, we see instead a salvo of 
cusses and subsequent slams of passionate disgust on 
tables and floors. This would all be fine and dandy 
if the recreation area were designed to deal with emo- 
tionally insecure people, but they are not. 

Consequently, the normal allotment of funds for equip- 
ment is quickly being exhausted. Just consider what 
you might have to break when there are no more pool 
sticks and paddles, and perhaps you might decide to 
break nothing at all. Perhaps you might decide to play 
the games as they should be played. 

While we're on the general subject of breaking things, 
I would like to applaud a positive aspect of it. That is, 
of course, Seth Cummings' recent "breaking" into the 
1000 point area. The talented senior has played top- 
flight ball for three years here, and we all congratulate 
this fitting testamony to a fine athletic career. 

I would also like to note a few other items. Next week 
a new sports editor, Jon Wilska, will take over the 
reigns of command. This means then, that this install- 
ment of Nick Naks will be last in a series that started 
in 1963. So in closing I want to express that it has 
been educational as well as gratifying. I have learned 
much about journalism, and my hope is that coverage 
has been adequate. 

As for a final note on athletics itself, I have, which will 
come as no surprise to anyone, no revolutionary philos- 
ophy concerning it. Save for the fact that I'm con- 
vinced of its great values to the individual. This is why 
initiative has always been applauded, from the found- 
ing of a soccer club up to its elevation to varsity status, 
to a group of hockey-enthusiasts who play at their own 
expense. Not to mention the two men who boxed down- 
town two years ago in a local series. 

What this amounts to is a general praise for all athletes, 
varsity, jayvee, intramural or simply those seeking 
personal enjoyment. Thus I feel the participation of 
everyone (including the ladies) is what makes the con- 
cept of athletics great. And it was to these general 
lines that Nick Naks have hopefully been focused. 

Good-Bye Bobby 

BUY WHERE MOST BATES PEOPLE DO ... 
See SHEP LEE at 

ADVANCE AUTO SALES. INC. 
24 FRANKLIN STREET AUBURN, MAINE 

Dial 784-5775 or 782-2686 
VALIANT-PLYMOUTH      CHRYSLER-IMPERIAL 

5-Year and 50,000 Mile Guarantee 
— GUARANTEED USED CARS — 
Excellent Service on All Makes 

107. Off on All Service Work to Bate*-Affiliated People 

The Bobcat basketball team 
broke out of a two game los- 
ing slump by taking three 
straight games from Colby, 
Tufts, and Clark to up their 
record to 15 and 8 with two 
games left on the schedule. 

Early Lead 

Wednesday night against 
the Colby Mules it looked as if 
the Cats had the game on ice 
within the first few minutes 
by jumping ahead to an easy 
20-8 lead. Despite the hot 
opening period for Bates, the 
Mules bounced back the sec- 
ond half and almost stole the 
victory from the Garnet five 
With 20 seconds remaining in 
the game Colby led 67-66 but 
Howie Alexander fouled with 
a 1 and 1 situation brought 
the Cats ahead to stay by 
sinking both free throws. How- 
ever the game was not denied 
until the final buzzer. With 3 
seconds left Colby called a 
time out and brought the ball 
in for the one shot play. 

The attempted shot was no 
good but in the ensuing ac- 
tion one of the Mules tapped 
the ball up and in but the ref- 
eree ruled that the tap-in 
came after time had run out. 
The 68-67 win over Colby was 
the second close victory for 
Bates over the Mules this sea- 
son and the third State Ser- 
ies win. 

Full Court Press 

Friday night against Tufts 
the Bates team took the early 
lead and rolled on to an 81-73 
victory. The Jumbos were un- 
able to break the rugged 
Bates full court press and time 
and again lost the ball while 
bringing it up court. Seth 
Cummings while scoring 18 
points brought his three year 
career point total to over 1000 
points and established him- 
self as one of the highest scor- 
ers in Bates basketball his- 
tory. 

Also scoring 18 was Howie 
Alexander and top scorer for 
the Cats was Bill Beisswanger 
with 19. 

On Saturday night the red 
hot Bobcats picked up whence 
they had left off Friday and 
took an easy 83-72 decision 
from Clark University. Bates 
scored first and then went on 
to build up a comfortable lead 
which Clark was only able to 
threaten once. At the start of 
the second half with the Bob- 
cats ahead by 9 the visitors 
began to click and pulled 
within one point of the falt- 
ering leaders. However, a 16 
point spurt by the Cats put 
the contest out of question 
and the game ended after 
Coach Peck had cleaned the 
bench and made substitutions 
for all of the regulars. 

Co-Capt. Beaudry Drives for Basket 

Pace Winners 
Again it was Alexander, 

Beisswanger and Cummings 
who paced the winners with 
22, 19 and 11 points respective- 
ly. 

The basketball team closes 
out State Series action tonight 

with a game at Bowdoin. and 
are assured of at least a tie 
for second place heading into 
the final game with a 3-2 rec- 
ord. Saturday night the Bob- 
cats close out their 23 game 
season when they meet M.I.T. 
in  Cambridge. 

LITTLE MAN ON CAMPUS 

I TAKE \1,b\&.COLUH5, THAT THl^ 15 YOUR flZ$T 
&.?tmHCX PAINTING FECM THE UNPWK? MOPEL.* 

EVERYONE LOVES to eat at 

EDDIE'S DRIVE IN RESTAURANT 
and enjoy the quiet contemporary atmosphere of our 
Beautiful AMBER ROOM. Our menus offer a wide variety 
and our prices are reasonable. 

WE NOW SERVE ALL OUR FOOD 
ON THE FINEST OF CHINA  

Now Serving Home Baked Beans 

- EVERY SATURDAY NIGHT - 

Complete Take Out Service 

AMBER     ROOM COCKTAILS 

165 High St. Tel. 782-9140 Auburn, Maine 
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